
of Spring Hill, Tennessee on the 19th day of M r~~irt:====~~:=~==::: 

RESOLUTION 12-25
 

A RESOLUTION TO AWARD A CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT
 
FOR THE INTERSTATE 65 SEWER LINE CROSSING
 

WHEREAS, the City of Spring Hill annexed areas on the east side of 
Interstate 65; and has passed a Plan of Services allowing for the provision of 
sewer service to these areas recently annexed into the city limits; 

WHEREAS, the City of Spring Hill accepted bids after appropriate 
advertisement from qualified, bonded contractors for the crossing of Interstate 65 
Sewer Line on February 8,2012; and 

WHEREAS, the city engineer has reviewed all proposals and has made a 
recommendation for the award of the contract for the construction of the Interstate 
65 Sewer Line Crossing; and 

WHEREAS, CFW, Inc. submitted the lowest bid of $347,040.00, with an 
additional valued engineering deduction of $28,000.00; and 

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the City of Spring Hill 
authorizes award of the construction for the Interstate 65 Sewer Line Crossing to 
CFW, Inc. of Fayetteville, TN, at a total amount of $319,040.00, as recommended 
by the Budget and Finance Advisory Committee on March 12, 2012. 

Passed and adopted by the Board of Mayor 

ATTEST:
 

April Goad, City Recorder 



SUMMARY OF BIDS 
For
 

City of Spring Hill, Tennessee
 
I-65 Sewer Line Crossing 

BID OPENING: February 8, 2012, 2:00 P.M. 

L & C Contractors, Inc. 
Fairview, Tennessee 37062 

Smith Contractors, Inc. 
Lawrenceburg, KY 40342 

Scott & Ritter, Inc. 
Bowling Green, KY 

Norris Bros Excavating, LLC 
Crossville, TN 

Underground Solutions 
Poway, CA 

Contracting Service, Inc. 
Culleoka, TN. 

Strack, Inc. 
Fairburn, GA 

Capitol Tunneling 
Columbus, Ohio 

Hawkins and Price LLC 
Wartrace, TN 

CFW, Inc. 
Fayetteville, TN 

Mofield Bros. Construction Co., LLC 
Carthage, HJ 

$359,790.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$1,047,400.00 

No Bid 

$1,077,200.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$397,600.00 

$347,040.00 

$910,625.00 

Dempsey, Dilling & Associates, P.C. 
File No. 0100-320 
Fax No. 615-220-5888 



DEMPSEY, DILLING & ASSOCIATES, P.C. 

ENGINEERING CONSUL.TANTS 

March 2, 2012	 File No. 0100-320 

Mr. Victor Lay 
City of Spring Hill, City Administrator 
199 Town Center Parkway 
Spring Hill, Tennessee 37174 

RE:	 CITY OF SPRING HILL, TENNESSEE 
1-65 SEWER LINE CROSSING 
BIDS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION 

Dear Mr. Lay: 

Dempsey, Dilling & Associates, P.C. (DDA) has reviewed the bids submitted for the 1-65 Sewer Une 
Crossing and the low bidder, in the amount of $347,040.0·0 (base bid) is CFW, Incorporated. After 
further review of the bids we have performed valued engineering which will save the City $28,000 on 
this project. A requested deduct in the amount of $80/LF has been offered by CFW, Incorporated to 
utilize SDR 26 fusible HDPE pipe in place of the 350 linear feet of SDR 26 fusible PVC. Therefore, 
we recommend the City accept the base bid minus the valued engineering deduct for a total project 
cost of $319,040.00 and award the contract to CFW Incorporated. 

Attached for your review is a letter from CFW, Incorporated dated 02-13-12 for the deduct and an 
exhibit of the project as bid. Should yolo! have any questions or comments, give me a call. 

Sincerely 
DEMPSEY, DILLING & ASSOCIATES, P.C. 
ENGINEERING CONSULTANTS 

cc:	 Mayor Michael Dinwiddie 
Jeff Foster, Public Works Director 
April Goad, City Recorder 

DEMPBEYDILUNGI.CDM 502 HAZELWOOD OR/Vl[ .MYRNA, TN 37167 TEL 615/220-5800 F"AX 615/220-5888 



Telephone (931) 433-2572 CFW, Inc. 

02-13:'12
 

To: Mr. Jerome D. Dempsey, P.E. 
Dempsey, Dilling and Associates, P.C. 
502 Hazelwood Drive 
Smyrna, TN 37167 

Re: Value Engineering: 30 inch SDR26 IPS HDPE in lieu of30 inch C-905 Fusible 
PVC Carrier Pipe 
Interstate 1-65 Sewer Line Crossing 
Springhill, TN 

Dear Jerome: 

As discussed and requested, CFW, Inc. hereby respectfully submits the following unit 
price revision for material substitutions on the above referenced project. 
Breakdown as follows: 

Item 3A: Deduct $80.00 per LF 
Item 3 B: Deduct $80.00 per LF 
Item 5: Deduct $80.00 per LF 

If you have any questions or comments concerning this revision, please contact me. 

. Carter Jr. 

cc: 1-65 Springhill, TN Bid File 

1824 C Pulaski Hwy., Post Office Box 678. Fayetteville, Tennessee 37334 



Dempse'ft Dilling & Associates. P.C. 
EXHIBIT - GRAVITY SEWER EXTENSION Engmeerng Consu1l1Jnts 

UNDER INTERSTATE 65 502 Hazelwood Drive -"'­
Smyrna. Tn 37167 T_-==::J200_r::=:il0 ~Feet SPRING HILL, MAURY COUNTY, TN phone: 615.220.5800 


