
RESOLUTION 11-125
 

A RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE AWARD OF CONTRACT FOR
 
THE CONSTRUCTION OF AN 18 INCH WATER TRANSMISSION LINE
 

ON PORT ROYAL ROAD
 

WHEREAS, the City of Spring Hill is in need of an 18 inch water transmission 
line on Port Royal Road; and 

WHEREAS, in order to improve water service and supply, the City of Spring 
Hill desires to provide for its citizens by increasing the size of the water line; and 

WHEREAS, the City of Spring Hill provided for the construction of an 18 inch 
water transmission line on Port Royal Road in the 2011-2012 Capital Improvement Plan; 
and 

WHEREAS, the City of Spring Hill advertised and accepted proposals for the 
construction of an 18 inch water transmission line on Port Royal Road on November 8, 
2011; and 

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the City of Spring Hill 
authorizes the award of contract to build an 18 inch water transmission line on Port Royal 
Road to Hawkins and Price, LLC of Wartrace, 1N for the amount of $574,374.50, as 
recommended by the Budget and Finance Advisory Committee on November 14,2011. 

Passed and adopted by the Board of Mayor and Aldermen of the City of 
Spring Hill, Tennessee on the 21 st day of November, 2011. 
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SUMMARY OF BIDS 
FOR
 

City of Spring Hill, Tennessee
 
2011 WATER SYSTEM IMPROVEMENTS
 

PORT ROYAL ROAD 18" WATER LINE TRANSMISSION LINE
 

L & C Contractors, Inc. 
FaiNiew, TN 

Contracting SeNice, Inc. 
Culleoka, TN. 
Peden Construction, LLC 
Culleoka, TN. 
Summit Constructors, Inc. 
Nashville, TN 
Hawkins and Price LLC 
Wartrace, TN 
Civil Constructors, Inc. 
Franklin, TN 
C.F.W., Inc. 
Fa etteville, TN 
Global Construction and Engineering 
Birmin ham, AL 
Norris Bros Excavating, LLC 
Crossville, TN 
Cleary Construction 
Tom kinsville, KY 
Scott & Ritter, Inc. 
Bowlin Green, KY 
Cunningham Construction & 
Development, LLC 
Nashville, TN 
Cumberland Valley Constructors, Inc. 
Nashville, TN 
Jenco Construction, Inc. 
Bon A ua, TN 
McMillan Construction Company, LLC 
Franklin, TN 

$767,115.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$574,374.50 

$741,519.00 

$896,860.00 

$793,961.50 

$849,462.50 

$789,155.00 

$708,505.00 

$631,936.25 

$774,585.00 

$873,817.35 

No Bid 

$20,000.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$35,000.00 

$21,100.00 

$17,500.00 

$22,500.00 

$20,000.00 

$15,000.00 

$50,000.00 

$14,500.00 

$17,500.00 

$24,188.00 

No Bid 

$778,525.00
 

No Bid
 

No Bid
 

No Bid
 

$631,834.50
 

$893,255.00
 

$819,500.00
 

$872,767.50
 

$786,720.00
 

$778,525.00
 

$860,475.00
 

$747,793.75
 

$753.940.00
 

$917,840.00
 

No Bid
 

Dempsey, Dilling & Associates, P.C. 
November 8, 2011 
File No. 0100-298 
Fax No. 615-220-5888 



BID OPENING 

CITY OF SPRfNG HILL, TENNESSEE 
PORT ROYAL ROAD 18" WATER LINE TRANSMISSION LINE 

DATE: NOVEMBER 8, 20 II 

TIME: 3:00 PM 

BID LOCATION: CITY HALL 
199 TOWN CENTER PARKWA Y 
SPRING HILL, TN 37174 

PROJECT ENGINEER: JEROME DEMPSEY, P.E. 
DEMPSEY, DILLING & ASSOCIATES, P.C. 
502 HAZELWOOD DRIVE 
SMYRNA, TENNESSEE 37167 

COMPANY NAME PHONE 
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DEMPSEY, DILLING & ASSOCIATES, P.C. 

ENGINEERING CONSULTANTS 

File No. 0100-298 November 16, 2011 

Mr. Victor Lay 
City of Spring Hill, City Administrator 
199 Town Center Parkway 
Spring Hill, Tennessee 37174 

RE:	 CITY OF SPRING HILL, TENNESSEE 
PORT ROYAL ROAD WATER LINE TRANSMISSION LINE 
BIDS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION 

Dear Mr. Lay:
 

Dempsey, Dilling & Associates, P.C. (DDA) has reviewed the bids submitted for the Port Royal Road
 
Water Line Transmission Line and the low bidder, in the amount of $574,374.50 (base bid) is
 
Hawkins and Price, LLC. DDA has verified the project references submitted by Hawkins and Price,
 
LLC.
 

Therefore, based on this information, it is DDA's recommendation that the City of Spring Hill accepts
 
the bid from Hawkins and Price, LLC in the amount of $574,374.50 (base bid) and award the project
 
based on this bid. Should you have any questions or comments, give me a call.
 

Sincerely
 
DEMPSEY, DILLING & ASSOCIATES, P.C.
 
ENGINEERING CONSULTANTS 

~~~ 

cc:	 Mayor Michael Dinwiddie 
Jeff Foster, Water Department Superintendent 
Caryl Giles, Water Plant Superintendent 
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